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Souhrn Bixler High Private Eye Bluray 1080p/720p: 

Teenage detective Xander DeWitt is the new kid at Bixler Valley High, and he's there to unravel the biggest
mystery of his life- the truth about his missing father. But in order to crack this case, Xander must learn to work
with a partner- fearless investigative reporter Kenzie Messina.

(TV Movie 2019) - IMDbYour browser indicates if you've visited this linkhttps imdb com › title › tt9173364:
Directed by Leslie Kolins Small With Jace Norman, Ariel Martin, Samiyah Womack, Mike C Nelson Xander is
looking for his dad, who went missing 3 months ago His mom sends him to stay with ex private dick grandpa in
Bixler, where the next lead is He teams up and investigates with his new high school's star reporter, Kenzie 3
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5bm703wprlxcpbbkz4v95yyoi Kids & Family 2019 1 hr 10 min Paramount+ Available on Paramount+, Prime
Video A teenage sleuth arrives at a new school, and he is determined to find his missing father In order to crack
the case, he has to work with a fearless female investigative reporter for the school newspaper | Nickelodeon |
FandomYour browser indicates if you've visited this linkhttps nickelodeon fandom com › wiki ›
Bixler_High_Private_Eye is a Nickelodeon Original Movie starring Jace Norman and Ariel Martin that
premiered on Monday, January 21, 2019 A teenage sleuth arrives at a new school, and he is determined to find
his missing father In order to crack the case, he goes on the breathtaking adventure Images for CzechMore
ImagesMore Images com: : Leslie Kolins Small Your browser indicates if you've visited this linkhttps
com › Bixler-Private-Leslie-Kolins-Small › dp › B08R5C3LHB Xander has a knack for solving mysteries and
gets his biggest case yet when his dad goes missing After his mom sends him to live with his grandfather in
Bixler Valley, he finds a surprising lead in the case and builds an unexpected partnership Watch Season 1 |
Prime VideoYour browser indicates if you've visited this linkhttps com › Bixler-High-Private-Eye-Season › dp ›
B07MXGXJZ7 Xander has a knack for solving mysteries and gets his biggest case yet when his dad goes
missing After his mom sends him to live with his grandfather in Bixler Valley, he finds a surprising lead in the
case and builds an unexpected partnership 1 h 7 min 2019 - Watch Online - On TV TonightYour browser
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indicates if you've visited this linkhttps ontvtonight com › guide › watch › movie › MV012198250000 › bixler-
high-private-eye html stars Jace Norman, Ariel Martin, Samiyah Womack, Ed Begley Jr , Terryn Westbrook,
Mike Nelson Specifications Genre - Drama/Adventure Country - USA Language - en Original Release Year -
2019 Run Time - 1h 10min More Information streaming: watch onlineYour browser indicates if you've visited
this linkhttps justwatch com › us › movie › bixler-high-private-eyeSynopsis Teenage detective Xander DeWitt is
the new kid at Bixler Valley High, and he's there to unravel the biggest mystery of his life- the truth about his
missing father But in order to crack this case, Xander must learn to work with a partner- fearless investigative
reporter Kenzie Messina - Eddie AguirreYour browser indicates if you've visited this linkhttps eddieaguirre
com › bixler-high-private-eye February 1, 2019 By Eddie Aguirre In Nickelodeon's original television movie ,
Xander DeWitt, a kid with a knack for solving mysteries, gets his biggest case to date when his dad goes
missing Nineoneone - Don't Call Me Crazy ( Your browser indicates if you've visited this linkhttps youtube
com › watch?v=ZngHcSM1XKETrack: Don't Call Me Crazy (2018)Composers: Tony Stafford / Michael Smith
/ Nineoneone / Hosu YoonMusic Genre: Dance Pop / Electro PopLyrics Everywhere i tu Trailer #2 | ? -
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